
Bid Tabulation
ITB 9-21
HERBICIDES
Latoria Kenniebrew, Buyer 

Item No. Description Unit of 
Measure

Mfg./Product 
No.

Price Each Estimated 
Quantity

Extended Price Unit of 
Measure

Mfg./Product 
No.

 Price Each Estimated 
Quantity

 Extended 
Price 

Unit of 
Measure

Mfg./Product 
No.

 Price Each Estimated  
Quantity

 Extended Price Unit of 
Measure

Mfg./Product 
No.

 Price Each Estimated  
Quantity

 Extended Price 

1 ROUNDUP PRO CONCENTRATE 2.5 
GAL CONTAINER  GAL  $          52.96 915 GAL 19,383.36$             GAL  

MONSATO/180610  $          21.05 915 GAL  $         19,260.75  GAL BAYER 524-529  $             16.69 915 GAL  $            15,271.35  GAL 
ROUNDUP PRO 
CONCENTRAT

E BAYER
 $         17.39 915 GAL  $           15,911.85 

2 ROUNDUP PRO CONCENTRATE 30 
GAL CONTAINER  GAL  $        428.90 660 GAL 9,435.80$               GAL  

MONSATO/180611 
 $          20.95 660 GAL  $         13,827.00  GAL BAYER 524-529  $             16.23 660 GAL  $            10,711.80  GAL 

ROUNDUP PRO 
CONCENTRAT

E BAYER
 $         16.98 660 GAL  $           11,206.80 

3 ROUNDUP PRO DRY  6.8 LB  $        102.95 235 LB. 3,557.95$               LB 

 MONSATO 
ROUNDUP QUICK 

PRO # 180613-
4X6.8 LBS  

 $          11.25 235 LB.  $           2,643.75  LB  MONSANTO 524-
505  $               7.81 235 LB.  $              1,835.35  LB 

 ROUNDUP 
QUICK 

PRO/BAYER 
 $           8.74 235 LB.  $             2,053.90 

4 MILESTONE 2.5 GAL  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 250 GAL  NO BID  GAL  CORTEVA/181522  $        300.00 250 GAL  $         75,000.00  GAL CORVETA 62719-
519  $           300.00 250 GAL  $            75,000.00  GAL MILESTONE/ 

CORTEVA  $       300.00 250 GAL  $           75,000.00 

5 OUST XP  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 185 LB  NO BID  LB  BAYER/ #180372  $          30.35 185 LB  $           5,614.75  LB BAYER 85588  $             25.30 185 LB  $              4,680.50  LB OUST 
XP/BAYER  $         27.00 185 LB  $             4,995.00 

6 HARDBALL 2.5 GAL CONTAINER  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 1275 GAL  NO BID  GAL 
 WINFIELD 2,4-B 
AMINE/#184804 - 

2.5 GAL JUGS 
 $          10.90 1275 GAL  $         13,897.50  GAL  5905-0201 HAE  $             31.11 1275 GAL  $            39,665.25  GAL  FREELEXX/ 

CORTEVA  $         20.50 1275 GAL  $           26,137.50 

7 HARDBALL 250 GAL CONTAINER  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 1500 GAL  NO BID  GAL 

 WINFIELD 2,4-D 
AMINE/#186319 - 

265 GAL 
CONTAINER 

 $            9.97 1500 GAL  $         14,955.00  GAL  5905-549 HAE  $             30.98 1500 GAL  $            46,470.00  GAL  FREELEXX/ 
CORTEVA  $         20.50 1500 GAL  $           30,750.00 

8 SURFACTANT 2.5 GAL CONTAINER  GAL  $          42.90 200 GAL 3,432.00$               GAL  WINIFIELD TOP 
SURF #180024  $          15.00 200 GAL  $           3,000.00  GAL HAE 5905-0201  $             11.77 200 GAL  $              2,354.00  GAL 

RRSI NIS/RED 
RIVER 

SPECIALTIES
 $           8.69 200 GAL  $             1,738.00 

9 GROUNDED 2.5 GAL  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  70  GAL  NO BID  GAL 
 WINFIELD 

INTERLOCK 
#181181 - 2.5 GAL 

 $          48.00  70  GAL  $           3,360.00  GAL  0110-0413 HAE  $             21.31  70  GAL  $              1,491.70  GAL 

 ELITE 
BARREN/RED 

RIVER 
SPECIALTIES 

 $         19.45  70  GAL  $             1,361.50 

10
PERSPECTIVE 5 LB CONTAINER

 NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 100 LB.  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 100 LB.  NO BID  LB BAYER 352-846  $             82.50 100 LB.  $              8,250.00  GAL  NO BID  NO BID 100 LB.  DISCONTINUED 

11
RODEO 2.5 GAL CONTAINER

 NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 200 GAL  NO BID  GAL 

 MONSANTO 
ROUNDUP 

CUSTOM #185840 - 
2.5 GAL 

 $          21.75 200 GAL  $           4,350.00  GAL BAYER 524-529  $             16.85 200 GAL  $              3,370.00  GAL 
ROUNDUP 

CUSTOM/BAYE
R

 $         17.97 200 GAL  $             3,594.00 

12 GROUND ZERO 1 PINT CONTAINER  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 460 PINTS  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 460 PINTS  NO BID  PINT HELENA 01224014  $               9.46 460 PINTS  $              4,351.60  PINT 
RRSI 

SECURE/RED 
RIVER 

 $           8.49 460 PINTS  $             3,905.40 

13
FOAM BUSTER
1 PINT CONTAINER  PINT  $            9.94 48 PINTS  $                477.12  PINT 

 WINFIELD FAST 
BREAK #180959 - 

PINT 
 $          12.00 48 PINTS  $              576.00  PINT CHEM HEL 

092210  $               9.16 48 PINTS  $                 439.68  QUART 
 RRSI 

DEFOAMER/RE
D RIVER 

 $           9.98 48 PINTS  $                479.04 

14
MSMA, 
30 GAL CONTAINER  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  600 GAL  NO BID  GAL 

 DREXEL MSMA 6 
PLUS #182555- 2.5 

GAL JUGS 
 $          26.30  600 GAL  $         15,780.00  GAL LUXEMBOURG 

PANEL 42519-3  $             24.33  600 GAL  $            14,598.00  GAL  MSMA 
6.0/DREXEL  $         25.84  600 GAL  $           15,504.00 

15 MSMA 250 GAL  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  1500 GAL  NO BID  GAL 

 DREXEL MSMA 6 
PLUS TOTE 

#186652 - 2.75 
GAL TOTE 

 $          25.90  1500 GAL  $         38,850.00  GAL LUXEMBOURG 
PANEL 42519-3  $             24.13  1500 GAL  $            36,195.00  GAL  MSMA 

6.0/DREXEL  $         25.84  1500 GAL  $           38,760.00 

16
SPRAY INDICATOR DYE

 GAL  $          79.90 24 GAL  $             1,917.60  GAL 
 WINIFIELD 
MYSTIC HC 

#184652 - 1 GAL 
 $          40.00 24 GAL  $              960.00  GAL HAE 031011  $             18.50 24 GAL  $                 444.00  GAL 

RRSI IVM 
MARKING 
DYE/RED 

RIVER 

 $         17.65 24 GAL  $                423.60 

17 TRYCERA 2.5 GAL  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 250 GAL  NO BID  GAL 
 DOW GARHORN 
3A #180352 - 2.5 

GAL JUGS 
 $          48.40 250 GAL  $         12,100.00  GAL 5905-580 HAE  $             86.80 250 GAL  $            21,700.00  GAL  VASTLAN/ 

CORTEVA  $         89.60 250 GAL  $           22,400.00 

18 TELAR 16 OZ CONTAINER  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 60 LB.  NO BID  OZ  DUPONT/181859  $          13.50 60 LB.  $         12,960.00  OZ BAYER 352-654  $             12.50 60 LB.  $            12,000.00  LB TELAR 
XP/BAYER  $       200.32 60 LB.  $           12,019.20 

19
OUTRIDER 20 OZ CONTAINER

 OZ  $        389.97 40 LB.  $           15,598.80  OZ  VALENT/180360  $          14.75 40 LB.  $           9,440.00  OZ VALENT 531-500  $             13.65 40 LB.  $              8,736.00  OZ OUTRIDER/ 
VALENT

  
15.89/318.80 
per 20oz. 
bottle  

40 LB.  $           10,169.60 

20 WEEDSTROY, 2, 4-D AMINE, 2.5 GAL 
CONTAINER

 GAL  $          48.97 245 LB  $             4,799.06  GAL 
 WINFIELD 2,4-D 
AMINE/#184804 - 

2.5 GAL JUGS 
 $          10.90 245 LB  $           2,670.50  GAL NUFARM 228-145  $             11.60 245 LB  $              2,842.00  GAL WEEDAR 

64/NUFARM  $         10.95 245 LB  $             2,682.75 

21
CAPSTONE 2.5 GAL CONTAINER

 NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 70 GAL  NO BID  GAL  DOW/186389  $          51.00 70 GAL  $           3,570.00  GAL CORVETA 62719-
527  $             51.00 70 GAL  $              3,570.00  GAL CAPSTONE/ 

CORVETA  $         51.00 70 GAL  $             3,570.00 

2 3 4kenniebrewl@jccal.org 1
RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, LLC.

Grand Total

HUMPHREY'S FARM TURF SUPPLY GREEN POINT AG HOLDINGS, LLC. HELENA AGRI

NEGOTIATED
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Bid Tabulation
ITB 9-21
HERBICIDES
Latoria Kenniebrew, Buyer 

Item No. Description Unit of 
Measure

Mfg./Product 
No.

Price Each Estimated 
Quantity

Extended Price Unit of 
Measure

Mfg./Product 
No.

 Price Each Estimated 
Quantity

 Extended 
Price 

Unit of 
Measure

Mfg./Product 
No.

 Price Each Estimated  
Quantity

 Extended Price Unit of 
Measure

Mfg./Product 
No.

 Price Each Estimated  
Quantity

 Extended Price 

2 3 4kenniebrewl@jccal.org 1
RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, LLC.

 

HUMPHREY'S FARM TURF SUPPLY GREEN POINT AG HOLDINGS, LLC. HELENA AGRI

NEGOTIATED

22 POLARIS  GAL  $        192.96  10 GAL  $                771.84  GAL  NUFARM/184528  $          63.50  10 GAL  $              635.00  GAL NUFARM 228-534  $             43.40  10 GAL  $                 434.00  GAL 
ARSENAL 

HERBICIDES/ 
BASF

 $         52.65  10 GAL  $                526.50 

23 ESPLANADE  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  90 GAL  NO BID  GAL  BAYER/ 1806070  $     1,218.56  90 GAL  $       109,670.40  GAL BAYER 432-1516  $        1,218.56  90 GAL  $          109,670.40  GAL ESPLANADE 
200 SC/BAYER  $    1,218.56  90 GAL  $         109,670.40 

24 IMAZAPIC  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 16  GAL  NO BID  GAL 
 BASF PLATEAU 
#180458 1 GAL 

JUGS  
 $        132.00 16  GAL  $           2,112.00  GAL NUFARM 71368-

99  $           107.13 16  GAL  $              1,714.08  GAL PANARAMIC 2 
SL  $         98.00 16  GAL  $             1,568.00 

25 TALSTAR P PROFESSIONAL 1 GAL 
CONTAINERS  GAL  $          79.92 12 GAL  $                959.04  GAL 

 CONTROL 
SOLUTIONS 
BIFEN L/T 

#184557 - 1 GAL 
JUGS  

 $          49.75 12 GAL  $              597.00  GAL  FMC 279-3206  $             52.56 12 GAL  $                 630.72  GAL  BIFEN IT  $         37.64 12 GAL  $                451.68 

26 OUST XTRA  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 100 LB.  NO BID  LB  BAYER/182605  $          30.85 100 LB.  $           3,085.00  LB BAYER 85588  $             25.28 100 LB.  $              2,528.00  LB OUST 
EXTRA/BAYER  $         27.00 100 LB.  $             2,700.00 

60,332.57 368,914.65$     428,953.43$        397,578.72$       

Red Font 

1 HUMPHREY'S FARM TURF SUPPLY

2 GREEN POINT AG HOLDINGS, LLC.

3 HELENA AGRI

4 RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, LLC.

YES
NO

YES
NO

GREEN POINT AG HOLDINGS, LLC. HELENA AGRI RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, LLC.

YES

YES
YES
YES
YES
NO

Addendum I
Bid Bond

YES
NO

HUMPHREY'S FARM TURF SUPPLY

Prices in Red indicate substitution items and/or quantity deviations. See bid submissions for details.
Purchasing Calculations

YES

4
Delivery is guranteed not later than _____ days 
after order date 75

PO Box 39, Cullman, AL 35016 | Misty Martin   P: 256.586.8760  E: humphriesturf@otelco.net

YES
YES

YES
Equal Opportunity Certification Form
Affidavit of Contractor
Non-Collusion Affidavit

YES
YES
YES

YES
YES

Debarmet Statement
Price Sheet

YES YES

5521 Eastcliff Industrial Blvd., Birmingham, AL 35210  | Kyle Shemeane  P: 205.838.1400  E: kyle.shemeane@greenpointag.com

PO Box 626, Selma, AL 36702 | Gregg Wall  P:  334.875.2737  E:  wallg@helenaagri.com

1324 N Hearne Ave. Ste., 120, Shreveport, LA 71107  | Chad Chambliss  P: 318.425.5944  E: chad.chambliss@rrsi.com

YES
YESYES

YES

Contact Information

PACA Page
YES
YES

YES
YES
YES
YES

Signature Page 

2,268.6100$                                                      ITEM TOTAL 1,429.3700$                                               2,226.6300$                                                  2,330.7400$                                                

Current Label and Material Safety Sheet
YES
YES

YES
NO

YES
YES

YES
YES

YES

YES
YES

10

Notification of Intent to Respond
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